
Des Moines Public Schools

Bid / Quote Number B7438

Supervisor Mel Green

Date 4/21/2016

Custodial Equipment

Capital Sanitary ,               

Des Moines, IA

Egan Supply Co,                          

Omaha, NE

First Choice Dist.,                     

Des Moines,IA

Hillyard                              

Des Moines, IA

National Everything 

Wholesale, Omaha, 

NE

SupplyWorks, 

Urbandale, IA

SupplyWorks, 

Urbandale, IA

VeritV Corp,                             

Des Moines,  IA

1. Carpet Spotter - Windsor Presto Mini -  3 each  $                     725.00  $                     395.00  $                     478.82 669.08$                       $                     388.88  $                     523.66 

Total Cost  $                  2,175.00  $                  1,185.00  $                  1,436.46  $                  2,007.24  $                  1,166.64  $                  1,570.98 

Make Proposed Advance Mosquito Mosquito Advance Clarke Windsor

Model Proposed Aquaspot 3 gal Super Motor 3G-0055A Aquaspot

BextSpot Pro AL-

130SP WINPR53

Warranty 3 year 7 yr parts/1 yr labor

Lifetimebody/ 1 yr 

motor 5yr parts/ 2yr labor 2yr parts/ 1 yr labor

2. Wet/Dry Vaccum - Advance AWD315 - 4 each  $                     735.00  $                     475.00  $                     763.33  $                     418.41  $                     599.75  $                     521.98 

Total Cost  $                  2,940.00  $                  1,900.00  $                  3,053.32  $                  1,673.64  $                  2,399.00  $                  2,087.92 

Make Proposed Advance ICE Mosquito Advance Clarke Renown

Model Proposed VL500 1W90 16-1000 VBAC VAC VL500

Summit Pro AL-

18WD REN08012-vp

Warranty

3 year

5 yr

lifetime tank / 3yr 

parts 3 yr 2yr parts/ 1 yr labor

3. Battery Powered Rider Scrubber - Tennant T726" - 1 ea $                12,775.00  $                  9,916.40 No Bid  $                  9,640.16  $                14,221.72 12,242.27$                11,709.06$                

Total Cost  $                12,775.00  $                  9,916.40  $                  9,640.16  $                14,221.72  $                12,242.27  $                11,709.06 

Make Proposed Spec ICE Advance Clarke Tennant Windsor

Model Proposed Spec R526 SC300 Focus II AL-56114031 T7-0052 WIN9.84-948.0

Warranty 5 yr 3 yr 2yr parts/ 1 yr labor

4. Onboard Scrubber Windsor Chairot iScrub 20 - 3 ea  $                  6,325.00 No Bid No Bid  $                  5,964.44  $                  9,764.63  $                  5,154.67 

Total Cost  $                18,975.00  $                17,893.32  $                29,293.89  $                15,464.01 

Make Proposed Advance Advance Clarke
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Model Proposed SC1500 SC 1500 Focus II AL56382626

Warranty 3 year 5 yr 2yr parts/ 1 yr labor

5. Carpet Extractor - Windsor Clipper Duo - 3 ea  $                  2,850.00 No Bid No Bid  $                  2,639.40 No Bid 3,021.48$                  

Total Cost  $                  8,550.00  $                  7,918.20  $                  9,064.44 

Make Proposed Advance Advance Windsor

Model Proposed ES400 ES400 WIN1_008-048.0

Warranty 3 year 5 yr

6. Upright  Vacuum - Advance AdVac12HP/Renown 

REN08025 - 20 ea  $                     156.00  $                     149.00  No Bid No Bid 241.86$                       $                     147.37 

Total Cost  $                  3,120.00  $                  2,980.00  $                  4,837.20  $                  2,947.40 

Make Proposed Koblenz Triple S Clarke Renown

Model Proposed U-80 ProSpec HD101 ReliaVac AL-03002A REN08025

Warranty 1 year 1 yr 2yr parts/ 1 yr labor

7. Portable Back Pack Vacuum Proteam Super Coach 

Pro10 - 20 ea  $                     289.00  $                     279.00  $                     257.64  $                     305.43 353.53$                       $                     289.99 307.42$                      

Total Cost  $                  5,780.00  $                  5,580.00  $                  5,152.80  $                  6,108.60  $                  7,070.60  $                  5,799.80  $                  6,148.40 

Make Proposed Proteam Mosquito Mosquito Proteam Proteam Proteam

Model Proposed Spec 10 gal Super Hepa 10-1011 SuperCoach Pro10 SuperCoach Pro10 SuperCoach Pro10

Warranty 7 yr parts/1 yr labor 2yr parts/ 1 yr labor

8. Stand On Commercial Vacuum -Windsor Chariot 2 

iVac 24 ATV - 1 ea  $                13,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6,190.70$                  

Total Cost  $                13,150.00  $                  6,190.70 

Make Proposed Tennant Windsor

Model Proposed R1Y WIN9.840-913.0

Warranty 2 year
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9. Stand On Commercial Vacuum -Windsor Chariot 2 

iVac 34 ATV - 1 ea 12,650.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10,699.87$                

Total Cost 12,650.00$                10,699.87$                

Make Proposed Advance Windsor

Model Proposed ES400 WIN9.840-933.0

Warranty 3 year

Delivery ARO 7 to 10 days 15 days 10 days 15 days 14 to  21 days 10 to 14 days 14 days

Price Good Until 6/30/17 Yes Yes Yes Yes No No Yes
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