
Des Moines Public Schools

Bid / Quote: Q7269

Date: August 17, 2015

Supervisor: Mel Green

Custodial Equipment

Capital Sanitary 

Supply,                    

Des Moines, Iowa

Capital Sanitary 

Supply,                      

Des Moines, Iowa

Egan Supply, 

Omaha, NE

Hillyard,                           

Des Moines, IA

National 

Everything 

Wholesale, 

Omaha, NE

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

US Coating 

Specialties & 

Supplies,                           

Jackson, MS
1. Carpet Spotter  - 3 each

Windsor Presto Mini Carpet Spotter

Make Proposed Advance Aquaspot  Mosquito 

 Advance Aqua 

Spot  Clarke  Spec  Betco E85509-00 

Model Proposed ADM5622000

 3 gallon 55psi 

Super Motor  ADV220000  Bextspot Pro  Spec  FiberPro Spotter 

 Cost/each  $                  595.00  $                  395.00  $                  623.40  $                  326.06  $                  523.66  $                721.50 

 Total Cost  $               1,785.00  $               1,185.00  $               1,870.20  $                  978.18  $               1,570.98  $            2,164.50 

Warranty

3 yr parts/2 yr 

labor

 7 yr parts / 1 yr 

labor 

3yr parts/ 2yr 

labor

3 yr parts / 2 yr 

labor  Attached 

2. Wet/ Dry Vacuum - 4 each

Advance AWD315W

Make Proposed

Proteam Proguard 

20 ICE Advance Clarke Renown Betco E83012

Model Proposed PRM107360 IW90 VL500 Summit Pro SQ REN08012-VP

Workman 

Wet/Dry 20 gal

 Cost/each  $                  545.00  $                  475.00  $                  629.40  $                  551.03  $                  492.99  $                559.00 

 Total Cost  $               2,180.00  $               1,900.00  $               2,517.60  $               2,204.12  $               1,971.96  $            2,236.00 

Warranty

 3 yr 

parts/labor/motor 

5 yr parts/ 5 year 

labor

3 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor

2 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor Attached

3. Battery Powered Rider Scrubber - 

2 each

Tennant T7 26"

Make Proposed Spec Advance 28" rider ICE Advance Clarke Tennent Tennent Windsor Betco E29926

Model Proposed Spec Advenger 2805-D RS26 Advenger X2805D Focus II Boost TENT7-650D TENT7-700-C WIN9-840-946.0 Stealth DRS26BT

 Cost/each  $             10,930.00  $           11,675.00  $               9,916.40  $             10,913.70  $               9,734.78  $             12,886.61  $          13,722.94  $          11,725.06  $          12,250.00 

 Total Cost  $            21,860.00  $           23,350.00  $            19,832.80  $            21,827.40  $            19,469.56  $            25,773.22  $          27,445.88  $          23,450.12  $          24,500.00 

Warranty 2 yr

5 yr parts/ 5 year 

labor

3 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor

3 yr parts / 2 yr 

labor Attached

4. Onboard Scrubber - 3 each

Windsor Chariot iScrub 20 Wet Battery AGM Battery No Bid

Make Proposed Advance SC1500 Advance SC1500 Advance Nacecare

Windsor Chariot 

Iscrub

Windsor Chariot 

Iscrub

Windsor Chariot 

Iscrub

Windsor Chariot 

Iscrub

Minuteman 

ER21DQT

Model Proposed ADM56104010 ADM56104011

SC 1500 

20DExoFlex TTB2120

WIN9.840.810.0AH 

battery  Auto

WIN9.840.811.0 

AH battery  On 

Board 

WIN9.840.812.0 

AGM Battery 

Auto

WIN9.840.813.0 

AGM Battery On 

Board  Micro Rider Disk 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Custodial Equipment

Capital Sanitary 

Supply,                    

Des Moines, Iowa

Capital Sanitary 

Supply,                      

Des Moines, Iowa

Egan Supply, 

Omaha, NE

Hillyard,                           

Des Moines, IA

National 

Everything 

Wholesale, 

Omaha, NE

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

US Coating 

Specialties & 

Supplies,                           

Jackson, MS
 Cost/each  $               5,100.00  $             5,626.00  $               5,266.95  $               7,203.98  $               5,287.30  $            5,499.00  $            5,590.98  $            5,970.58  $             7,071.60 

Total Cost $15,300.00 $16,878.00 $15,800.85 $21,611.94 $15,861.90 $16,497.00 $16,772.94 $17,911.74 $21,214.80 

Warranty

3yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor

3yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor

3 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor

10 yr housing/ 3yr 

parts

10 yr housing /3 

yr parts & labor

5. Carpet Extractor - 3 each

Windsor Clipper Duo

Make Proposed

Advance 

Aquaclean 16 No Bid Advance Clarke Windsor ICE IE410

Model Proposed ADM 56265000

 Aqua Clean 16 Xp 

ADV265000  L-18 Clean Trac  Spec EXT ICE 

 Cost/each  $               2,200.00  $               2,123.40  $               2,306.29  $               3,021.48  $             1,402.80 

Total Cost $6,600.00 $6,370.20 $6,918.87 $9,064.44 $4,208.40 

Warranty

3 yr parts/ 2yr 

labor

3 yr parts / 2 yr 

labor

3 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor 5 yr

6. Upright Vacuum Cleaner - 20 

each

Advance AD VAC 12 hp / Renown 

REN08025

Make Proposed Koblenz Triple S Advance Clarke Renown BETCO E88820

Model Proposed U-40 ProSpec HD101

VU500 12" Single 

motor ReliaVac REN8025

HF14 Upright 

Dual Motor 

 Cost/each  $                  156.00  $                  149.00  $                  246.81  $                  173.14  $                  156.00  $                396.50 

Total Cost $3,120.00 $2,980.00 $4,936.20 $3,462.80 $3,120.00 $7,930.00 

Warranty 1 yr 1 yr 1 yr 1 yr Attached

7. Portable Back Pack Vacuum -  20 

each

Proteam Super Coach Pro 10 

#107304

Make Proposed Spec Mosquito Spec Spec Spec Spec

Model Proposed Spec 10 qrt Super HePA Spec Spec Spec Spec

 Cost/each  $                  289.00  $                  279.00  $                  305.43  $                  329.64  $                  301.43  $                366.04 

Total Cost $5,780.00 $5,580.00 $6,108.60 $6,592.80 $6,028.60 $7,320.80 

Warranty 3 yr

7 yr parts / 1 yr 

labor 3 yr parts & labor

8. Windsor Taz Scrubber - 2 each

Windsor Taz w/Orb Technology

Make Proposed Advance No Bid Advance Clarke Spec Hos Orbot 

Model Proposed FM810ST FM810 FM 40XL Spec HOSOSB17

 Cost/each  $               2,425.00  $               1,669.63  $               2,478.04  $               3,597.10  $             3,206.40 

Total Cost $4,850.00 $3,339.26 $4,956.08 $7,194.20 $6,412.80 

Warranty

3 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor

 3 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor 

 3 yr parts/ 2 yr 

labor  1 yr 

TOTAL COST:  $            38,425.00  $            10,855.00  $            39,696.11  $            46,072.67  $            43,764.76  $         50,044.30 

Delivery Days ARO: 7 to 10 days  10- 15 days  30 days  21 Days  10 to 14 days  10 days 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Custodial Equipment

Capital Sanitary 

Supply,                    

Des Moines, Iowa

Capital Sanitary 

Supply,                      

Des Moines, Iowa

Egan Supply, 

Omaha, NE

Hillyard,                           

Des Moines, IA

National 

Everything 

Wholesale, 

Omaha, NE

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

Supplyworks, 

Urbandale, IA

US Coating 

Specialties & 

Supplies,                           

Jackson, MS
PRICING FIRM UNTIL 6/30/16 YES  YES  YES  YES  NO  NO   YES 

NO BID: First Choice DEMO AVAILABLE DEMO AVAILABLE

Coupon Offered
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