
Des Moines Public Schools

Bid / Quote: B7237

Date: 5/8/2015

Supervisor: Sandy Huisman

Department: CNC

Descripton Boelter LLC,                

Mitchville, IA

Bolton Hay                      

Des Moines, IA

Central Restaurant 

Products, 

Indianapolis,IN

Douglas Equipment, 

Bluefield, W VA

Dupey Equipment, 

Clive, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Martin Bros.,                   

West Union, IA

Reinhart Food Service, 

Cedar Rapids, IA 

Restaurant Link, 

Leawood, KS

 Sam Tell & Son, 

Farmingdale, NY 

Section A No Bid No Bid 

1a - Metro C569-SDS-L  - 

qty 2 ea

Brand Bid  Intermetro  Metro  No Bid  Metro  Metro  Metro  Metro  Metro 

Model Bid  C569-SDS-L  C569-SDS-L  C569-SDS-L  C569-SDS-L  C569-SDS-L  C569-SDS-L  C569-SDS-L 

 Cost each  $           4,209.83  $                   3,595.00  $           3,834.22  $            3,943.00  $                       4,399.00  $           3,951.67  $           4,016.71 

Total Cost  $           8,419.66  $                   7,190.00  $           7,668.44  $            7,886.00  $                       8,798.00  $           7,903.34  $           8,033.42 

2A. Cres Cor 100-1841 

DSD - 8 each

Brand Bid  CresCor  Cres Cor  No Bid  CresCor  CresCor  CresCor  CresCor  CresCor 

Model Bid  100-1841-DSD  100-1841-DSD  100-1841-DSD  100-1841-DSD  100-1841-DSD  100-1841-DSD  100-1841-DSD 

Cost each  $           1,379.12  $                   1,285.00  $           1,288.65  $            1,345.00  $                       1,176.00  $           1,398.60  $           1,328.67 

Total Cost  $         11,032.96  $                10,280.00  $         10,309.20  $          10,760.00  $                       9,408.00  $         11,188.80  $         10,629.36 

3a. Cres Cor CSC500-2020 

- 3 each

Brand Bid  Crescor  CresCor  No Bid  CresCor  CresCor  CresCor  BK Resources CresCor

Model Bid  500-2020  CSC-500-2020  CSC-500-2020  CSC-500-2020  CSC-500-2020  BK-GRD-2 500-2020

Cost each  $              475.33  $                      270.00  $              279.62  $               442.00  $                          485.00  $                91.41  $              427.85 

Total Cost  $           1,425.99  $                      810.00  $              838.86  $            1,326.00  $                       1,455.00  $              274.23  $           1,283.55 

4A. Beverage Air SM49N-

S - 4 Each

Brand Bid  Beverage Air  Beverage Air  Beverage Air  Beverage Air   Beverage Air  Beverage Air  Norlake Beverage Air

Model Bid  SM49N-S  SM49N-S  SM49N-S  SM49N-S  SM49N-S  SM49N-S  AR122SSS/0-A  SM49N-S 

Cost each  $           2,374.80  $                   1,805.00  $                2,243.00  $           2,201.87  $            2,164.00  $                       2,209.00  $           1,952.56  $           2,081.77 

Total Cost  $           9,499.20  $                   7,220.00  $                8,972.00  $           8,807.48  $            8,656.00  $                       8,836.00  $           7,810.24  $           8,327.08 

5A. Beverage Air SM58N-

S - 8 each

Brand Bid  Beverage Air  Beverage Air  Beverage Air  Beverage Air  Beverage Air  Beverage Air  TRUE Beverage Air

Model Bid  SM58N-S  SM58N-S  SM58N-S  SM58N-S  SM58N-S  SM58N-S  TMC-58-S  SM58N-S 

Cost each  $           2,879.04  $                   2,189.00  $                2,720.00  $           2,669.38  $            2,623.00  $                       2,678.00  $           2,429.39  $           2,523.78 

Total Cost  $         23,032.32  $                17,512.00  $             21,760.00  $         21,355.04  $          20,984.00  $                     21,424.00  $         19,435.12  $         20,190.24 

6A. Cambro DRS360 9 Ea

Brand Bid  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro Cambro 

Model Bid  DRS360131  DRS-360  DRS360480  DRS360  DRS360480  DRS360480  DRS360 DRS-360

Cost each  $              125.08  $                      115.00  $                   120.00  $              120.49  $               115.00  $                          119.00  $              123.93  $              117.05 

Total Cost  $           1,125.72  $                   1,035.00  $                1,080.00  $           1,084.41  $            1,035.00  $                       1,071.00  $           1,115.37  $           1,053.45 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Descripton Boelter LLC,                

Mitchville, IA

Bolton Hay                      

Des Moines, IA

Central Restaurant 

Products, 

Indianapolis,IN

Douglas Equipment, 

Bluefield, W VA

Dupey Equipment, 

Clive, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Martin Bros.,                   

West Union, IA

Reinhart Food Service, 

Cedar Rapids, IA 

Restaurant Link, 

Leawood, KS

 Sam Tell & Son, 

Farmingdale, NY 

7A. Youth Salad bar - 

Cambro VBRL6 - 2 each

Brand Bid  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro Cambro

Model Bid  VBRL6110  VBRL6  VBRL6110  VBRL6  VBRL6110  VBRL6110  VBRL6110  VBRL6110 

Cost each  $           1,606.39  $                   1,475.00  $                1,547.00  $           1,547.44  $            1,475.00  $                       1,532.70  $           1,591.65  $           1,503.23 

Total Cost  $           3,212.78  $                   2,950.00  $                3,094.00  $           3,094.88  $            2,950.00  $                       3,065.40  $           3,183.30  $           3,006.46 

8A. Cambro VBRR6 - 4 

each

Brand Bid  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro Cambro

Model Bid  VBRR6191  VBRR6  VBRR6191  VBRR6  VBRR6191  VBRR6191  VBRR6191 VBRR6

Cost each  $              218.27  $                      200.00  $                   210.00  $              210.26  $               201.00  $                          208.26  $              216.27 204.26

Total Cost  $              873.08  $                      800.00  $                   840.00  $              841.04  $               804.00  $                          833.04  $              865.08  $              817.04 

9A. Cambro CSU44487 - 

13 each

Brand Bid  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro  Cambro Cambro

Model Bid  CSU4487480  CSU4487  CSU44487480  CSU44487480  CSU44487480  CSU44487480  CSU44487480 CSU44487

Cost each  $              391.66  $                      360.00  $                   377.00  $              377.29  $               361.00  $                          373.70  $              390.69  $              366.51 

Total Cost  $           5,091.58  $                   4,680.00  $                4,901.00  $           4,904.77  $            4,693.00  $                       4,858.10  $           5,078.97  $           4,764.63 

10A. Atlas CAIH-4 - 2 

each

Brand Bid  Atlas  Atlas  No Bid  Altas  Atlas  Atlas Metal  Atlas Atlas

Model Bid  CAIH-4  CAIH-4  CAIH-4  CAIH-4  CAIH-4  CAIH-4  CAIH-4 

Cost each  $           7,255.86  $                   7,245.00  $           6,648.35  $            6,784.00  $                       7,244.00  $           6,999.48 7063.84

Total Cost  $         14,511.72  $                14,490.00  $         13,296.70  $          13,568.00  $                     14,488.00  $         13,998.96  $         14,127.68 

Total Section A  $        77,099.29  $               65,932.00  $             39,567.00  $        71,116.41  $     71,116.41  $         71,627.00  $                    73,165.54  $        71,744.92  $        71,179.46 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Descripton Boelter LLC,                

Mitchville, IA

Bolton Hay                      

Des Moines, IA

Central Restaurant 

Products, 

Indianapolis,IN

Douglas Equipment, 

Bluefield, W VA

Dupey Equipment, 

Clive, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Martin Bros.,                   

West Union, IA

Reinhart Food Service, 

Cedar Rapids, IA 

Restaurant Link, 

Leawood, KS

 Sam Tell & Son, 

Farmingdale, NY 

Section B

1B. Single Door Freezer 

Trauslen G12010 - 3 Each

Brand Bid  Traulsen   Traulsen  No Bid  Traulsen  Beverage Air  Traulsen  Delfield  Traulsen  Traulsen  Artic Air Traulsen

Model Bid  G12010  G12010  G12010  FB27-1S  G12010  GCL1_SH  G12010  G12010  AF23 G12010

Cost each  $       3,357.00  $           3,362.74  $                   3,168.00  $                3,021.00  $           2,870.95  $         2,912.85  $            3,100.00  $                       3,481.00  $           1,503.26 No Price Listed

Total Cost  $    10,071.00  $         10,088.22  $                   9,504.00  $                9,063.00  $           8,612.85  $         8,738.55  $            9,300.00  $                     10,443.00  $           4,509.78 

2B. 3 Door Freezer - 

Traulsen G31010 - 5 ea.

Brand Bid  Traulsen   Traulsen  No Bid  Traulsen  Beverage Air  Traulsen  Delfield  Traulsen  Traulsen  Supera Traulsen

Model Bid  G31010  G31010  G31010  FB72-15  G31010  GCF2SH  G31010  G31010  F3R-1 G31010

Cost each  $       6,162.00  $           6,166.14  $                   5,810.00  $                5,397.00  $           5,345.69  $         4,100.55  $            5,700.00  $                       6,379.00  $           3,858.82  $           5,802.40 

Total Cost  $    30,810.00  $         30,830.70  $                29,050.00  $             26,985.00  $         26,728.45  $      20,502.75  $          28,500.00  $                     31,895.00  $         19,294.10  $         29,012.00 

3B. 1 Section Refrigerator 

- Traulsen G10010 - 3 

each

Brand Bid  Traulsen   Traulsen  No Bid  Traulsen  Beverage Air  Traulsen  Delfield  Traulsen  Traulsen  Artic Air Traulsen

Model Bid  G10010  G10010  G10010  RB27.1S  G10010  GBR 1-SH  G10010  G10010  AR23 G10010

Cost each  $       2,993.00  $           2,999.82  $                   2,825.00  $                2,577.00  $           2,539.62  $         2,511.20  $            2,800.00  $                       3,106.00  $           1,372.83  $           3,155.26 

Total Cost  $       8,979.00  $           8,999.46  $                   8,475.00  $                7,731.00  $           7,618.86  $         7,533.60  $            8,400.00  $                       9,318.00  $           4,118.49  $           9,465.78 

4B. Combi Oven Rational 

SCC WE 102G - 2 each

Brand Bid  Alto Shaam  Rational  Rational   Rational  Rational  Rational  Alto Shaam  Rational  Rational  Rational Rational

Model Bid  CTP10-20G  A128206.19E  A128206.19E  SCC WE 102G  A128206.19E  SCC WE 102G  CTP10-206  SCC WE 102G  SccWE102NG  A128206.19D A128206

Cost each  $    21,279.50  $         24,336.45  $             23,471.00  $                21,745.00  $             23,999.00  $         21,225.03  $      20,146.76  $          20,899.00  $                     25,201.00  $         23,615.40  $         22,934.64 

Total Cost  $    42,559.00  $         48,672.90  $             46,942.00  $                43,490.00  $             47,998.00  $         42,450.06  $      40,293.52  $          41,798.00  $                     50,402.00  $         47,230.80  $         45,869.28 

5B. Combi Oven Rational 

SCC WE 102E- 2 each

Brand Bid  Alto Shaam  Rational  Rational   Rational  Rational  Rational  Alto Shaam  Rational  Rational  Rational Rational

Model Bid  CTP10-20E  A128106.43  A128106.43  SCC WE 102E  A128106.43  SCC WE 102E  CPT10-20E  SCC WE 102E  SCCWE102E  A128106.43  A128106.43 

Cost each  $    16,908.50  $         19,534.62  $             19,171.00  $                18,220.00  $             19,385.00  $         17,141.96  $      15,592.56  $          17,046.00  $                     21,040.00  $         21,607.51  $         18,851.57 

Total Cost  $    33,817.00  $         39,069.24  $             38,342.00  $                36,440.00  $             38,770.00  $         34,283.92  $      31,185.12  $          34,092.00  $                     42,080.00  $         43,215.02  $         37,703.14 

6B. Combi Oven Rational 

SCC WE 102E - 1 each

Brand Bid  Alto Shaam  Rational  Rational   Rational  Rational  Rational  Alto Shaam  Rational  Rational  Rational Rational

Model Bid  CTP10-20E  A128106.12  A128106.12  SCCWE 102E  A128106.12  SCCWE 102E  CTP10-20E  SCC WE 102E  SCC WE 102E  A128106.12  A128106.12 

Cost each  $    18,592.00  $         19,241.21  $             19,196.00  $                18,951.00  $             19,299.00  $         17,068.63  $      15,592.56  $          17,652.00  $                     22,073.00  $         20,382.99  $         18,990.23 

Total Cost  $    18,592.00  $         19,241.21  $             19,196.00  $                18,951.00  $             19,299.00  $         17,068.63  $      15,592.56  $          17,652.00  $                     22,073.00  $         20,382.99  $         18,990.23 

Total Section B  $ 144,828.00  $      156,901.73  $          104,480.00  $             145,910.00  $          149,846.00  $      145,312.79  $   132,596.10  $       139,742.00  $                 166,211.00  $      138,751.18  $      141,040.43 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Descripton Boelter LLC,                

Mitchville, IA

Bolton Hay                      

Des Moines, IA

Central Restaurant 

Products, 

Indianapolis,IN

Douglas Equipment, 

Bluefield, W VA

Dupey Equipment, 

Clive, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Hockenbergs,               

Des Moines, IA

Martin Bros.,                   

West Union, IA

Reinhart Food Service, 

Cedar Rapids, IA 

Restaurant Link, 

Leawood, KS

 Sam Tell & Son, 

Farmingdale, NY 

Section C  No Bid   No Bid  No Bid No Bid

1c. 1 Section Refrigerator 

Traulsen G10010 - 1 each

Brand Bid  Traulsen  Traulsen  Traulsen  Traulsen  Traulsen  Artic Air 

Model Bid  G10011  G10010  G10010  G1011  G10010  AR23 

Cost each  $           2,999.82  $                   2,825.00  $           2,539.62  $            2,804.00  $                       3,106.00  $           1,372.83 

Total Cost  $           2,999.82  $                   2,825.00  $           2,539.62  $            2,804.00  $                       3,106.00  $           1,372.83 

2C. Roll In Refrigerator 

Traulsen ARI232LUT-FHS - 

1 each

Brand Bid  Traulsen  Traulsen  Traulsen  Traulsen  Traulsen  TRUE 

Model Bid  AR1232LUT-FHS  AR1232LUT-FHS  AR1232LUT-FHS  AR1232LUT- FHS  AR1232LUT- FHS  STG2RRI-2S 

Cost each  $           9,507.03  $                   8,385.00  $           9,027.64  $            8,890.00  $                       9,194.00  $           4,810.43 

Total Cost  $           9,507.03  $                   8,385.00  $           9,027.64  $            8,890.00  $                       9,194.00  $           4,810.43 

Total Section C  $         12,506.85  $                11,210.00  $         11,567.26  $      11,567.26  $          11,694.00  $                    12,300.00  $           6,183.26 

Grand Total  $ 144,828.00  $      246,507.87  $          104,480.00  $             223,052.00  $          189,413.00  $      227,996.46  $   215,279.77  $       223,063.00  $                 251,676.54  $      216,679.36  $      212,219.89 
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