
Des Moines Public Schools

Bid / Quote: B7145

Date: 2/13/2015

Supervisor: Mel Green

Description

American Hotel                                 

Vernon Hills, Il

Amsan                  

Urbandale,  IA

Capital Sanitary 

Supply                                 

Des Moines, IA

Ecolab                                   

St. Paul, MN

Ecolab                                

St. Paul, MN

Egan Supply Co.    

Omaha, Ne

First Choice Dist.                   

Des Moines, IA

First Choice Dist.                     

Des Moines, IA

Hillyard Inc                 

Urbandale, IA

National Everything 

Wholesale                 

Urbandale, IA

1. Ecolab Front Court Water Base #61110425 `

Est Gallon usage 550                                                                   550                               550                                     550                                        550                                       550 

Proposed Manufacturer Betco Ecolab No Bid Ecolab Triple S No Bid Buckeye Hillyard No Bid

Proposed Brand / Item number 6800500 61110425 61110425

Full Court Press SS-

32001 Arona 300 Tip Off HIL0028207

Proposed Unit of Measure 5 gal pail 5 gal pail 5 gal pail 5 gal pail 5 gal 5 gal

Price Per Unit of Measure (Gallons) $383.87 149.12$                      149.12$                     238.34$                           223.76$                               142.70$                             

Gallons / UOM 5 5 5 5 5 5

Price per gallon $76.77 $29.82 $29.82 $47.67 $44.75 $28.54

Total $42,225.70 $16,403.20 $16,403.20 $26,217.40 $24,613.60 $15,697.00

2. Ecolab Gemstar Laser #61189723

Est Gallon usage 1,375                                1,375                           1,375                            1,375                          1,375                           1,375                                1,375                                   1,375                                   1,375                                  1,375                                  

Proposed Manufacturer Betco Ecolab Ecolab Ecolab Ecolab Triple S ABC Compounding Buckeye Hillyard MidLab

Proposed Brand / Item number 6590500 61189723 Laser PHAZ0R 61189723

Low Maintenance 

6100026 Final Lap SS-48085 Peak Finish 656105SA Clarion 25 North Star Hil0052807 Ultra Shield ML-152500

Proposed Unit of Measure 5 gal pail 2.5 gal pail 4 gal /case 2.5 gal pail 5 gal pail 2/ 2.5 gal per case 5 gal 5 gal 5 gal 5 gal

Price Per Unit of Measure $53.50 28.17$                         49.00$                          28.17$                       94.29$                         62.40$                              54.68$                                 58.41$                                 53.92$                                52.80$                                

Gallons / UOM 5 3 4 3 5 5 5 5 5 5

Price Per gallon $10.70 $11.27 $12.25 $11.27 $18.86 $12.48 $10.94 $11.68 $10.78 $10.56

Total $14,712.50 $15,493.50 $16,843.75 $15,493.50 $25,929.75 $17,160.00 $15,037.00 $16,062.75 $14,828.00 $14,520.00

3. Ecolab Gemstar Gemini #61189733

Est Gallon usage 1,688                                1,688                           1,688                            1,688                          1,688                           1,688                                1,688                                   1,688                                   1,688                                  1,688                                  

Proposed Manufacturer Betco Ecolab Ecolab Ecolab Ecolab Triple S ABC Compounding Buckeye Hillyard MidLab

Proposed Brand / Item number 6320500 61189733 Gemini Pro 6101035 61189733

MonoStar Ultra High 

64895513 Turn $ SS-48075 Classic 655655PA Clarion 25 Top Shape Hil0052207 KnockOut ML_132000

Proposed Unit of Measure 5 gal pail 2.5 gal pail 5 gal pail 2.5 gal pail 2/2 gal case 2/ 2.5 gal per case 5 gal 5 gal 5 gal 5 gal

Price Per Unit of Measure $53.71 22.70$                         $43.40 22.70$                       105.29$                       57.60$                              50.30$                                 58.41$                                 43.44$                                42.90$                                

Gallons/UOM 5 2.5 5 3 4 5 5 5 5 5

Price per gallon $10.74 $9.08 $8.68 $9.08 $26.32 $11.52 $10.06 $11.68 $8.69 $8.58

Total $18,127.13 $15,322.50 $14,647.50 $15,322.50 $44,419.22 $19,440.00 $16,976.25 $19,713.38 $14,661.00 $14,478.75

4. Ecolab Blast #65910022

Est Gallon usage 1,000                                1,000                           800                                800                             800                               800                                   800                                       800                                       800                                     800                                     

Proposed Manufacturer Betco Ecolab Ecolab Ecolab Ecolab Triple S ABC Compounding Buckeye Hillyard Puro Azul

Proposed Brand / Item number 1540500 65910022 Maxx Floor 65910022 Heavy Duty 6100034 Pit Stop SS-48076 Sprint 622805SA Ripsaw 50251000 Devastator Hil0014707 AZ-032385

Proposed Unit of Measure 5 gal pail 5 gal pail 2.5 gal pail 5 gal pail 5 gal pail 2 / 2.5 gal per case 5 gal 5 gal 5 gal 5 gal

Price Per Unit of Measure $42.84 35.30$                         64.15$                          35.30$                       72.79$                         36.95$                              29.91$                                 58.73$                                 33.78$                                32.50$                                

Gallons / UOM 5 5 2.5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5

Price per gallon $8.57 $7.06 $25.66 $7.06 $14.56 $7.39 $5.98 $11.75 $6.76 $6.50

Total $8,568.00 $7,060.00 $20,528.00 $5,648.00 $11,646.40 $5,912.00 $4,785.60 $9,396.80 $5,404.80 $5,200.00

B7145 Floor Finishes 1 2/17/2015



Des Moines Public Schools

Description

American Hotel                                 

Vernon Hills, Il

Amsan                  

Urbandale,  IA

Capital Sanitary 

Supply                                 

Des Moines, IA

Ecolab                                   

St. Paul, MN

Ecolab                                

St. Paul, MN

Egan Supply Co.    

Omaha, Ne

First Choice Dist.                   

Des Moines, IA

First Choice Dist.                     

Des Moines, IA

Hillyard Inc                 

Urbandale, IA

National Everything 

Wholesale                 

Urbandale, IA

5. Ecolab Rivet #61221166

Est Gallon usage 2,250                                2,250                           2,250                            2,250                          2,250                                2,250                                   2,250                                  

Proposed Manufacturer Betco Ecolab Ecolab Ecolab Triple S ABC Compounding No Bid Hillyard No Bid

Proposed Brand / Item number 6070500 61221166 PHAZER 6100761 61221166 Acrylic Sealer SS-48086

Floor Tile Sealer 

638705SA

Not Needed with Clarion 

25 Seak 341 Hil0034107

Proposed Unit of Measure 5 gal pail 2.5 gal pail 4 gal /ca 2.5 gal pail 5 gal pail 5 gal 5 gal

Price Per Unit of Measure 49.34$                              22.61$                         52.55$                          22.61$                       60.69$                              38.36$                                 45.56$                                

Gallons / UOM 5 2.5 4 2.5 5 5 5

Price per gallon 9.87$                                9.04$                           13.14$                          9.04$                          12.14$                              7.67$                                   9.11$                                  

Total 22,203.00$                      20,349.00$                29,559.38$                  20,349.00$               27,310.50$                     17,262.00$                         20,502.00$                       

6. Spartan Workforce Cleaner

Est Gallon usage 100                                    100                              100                                100                             100                                   100                                       100                                       100                                     

Proposed Manufacturer Betco Ecolab Spartan Ecolab Triple S ABC Compounding Buckeye Hillyard No Bid

Proposed Brand / Item number 6950400 61027049 SPA582204 61027049 Replay SS-32009 DO IT ALL 655905SA Coliseum Waterless

Super Shine All 

Hil0014006

Proposed Unit of Measure 1 gal / 4 per cs 4 / 1 gl case Case 4 / 1 gl case 4 / 1 gal per case CS 4 x 1 gal 5 gal 4 -  1 gal /case

Price Per Unit of Measure $38.65 46.85$                         43.25$                          46.85$                       48.68$                              37.94$                                 78.65$                                 45.05$                                

Gallons / UOM 4 4 4 4 4 4 5 4

Price per gallon $9.66 $11.71 $10.81 $11.71 $12.17 $9.49 $15.73 $11.26

Total $966.25 $1,171.25 $1,081.25 $1,171.25 $1,217.00 $948.50 $1,573.00 $1,126.25

Grand Total $106,802.58 $75,799.45 $82,659.88 $74,387.45 $81,995.37 $97,256.90 $55,009.35 $71,359.53 $72,219.05 $34,198.75

B7145 Floor Finishes 2 2/17/2015


