DesMoines

PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Instructions:

We do not guarantee the required quantities as these are estimates only; based on
an annual demand.

Q7110 Classroom Special Paper &
Laminating Items

Des Moines Independent
C ity School District

Complete the fields that are highlighted in orange in Column D.

Division of Purchasing

To prevent disqualification do not alter the formatting on the worksheet.

1915 Prospect Road Suite 1200

All anticipated orders will be placed on an “as needed basis”.

Des Moines, IA 50310

Once the spreadsheet is complete email it to:

Kathleen.Kahler@dmschools.org

Pricing must remain firm for 12 months, and must include all costs including freight,
the District will not pay any additional costs for products delivered.

Brown & Saenger Sioux
Falls/SD/57118

AFP Industries Miami Fl
33280

New Precision Technology,
LLC d/b/a USI Education &

PYRAMID SCHOOL
PRODUCTS TAMPA, FL

School Specialty Inc
Lancaster, PA 17601

STANDARD STATIONERY
SUPPLY CO WHEELING IL

Smith Office Supply,
Hollywood, FL

ITEM#|DMPS SKU# 5002003860
1|DESCRIPTION Clear Contact Paper, 18"x75" Self-Adhesive Roll
1|ESTIMATED USAGE 60
1|MANUFACTURER NAME [Kittrich Con-Tact Brand 75F-C9995-01 As Spec No Bid KITTRICH As Spec
**MINIMUM ORDER IS 36
1|MANUFACTURER# 75F-C9995-01 As Spec No Bid ROLLS** As Spec
1{uoOM Roll Roll Roll Roll Roll Roll Roll
1|PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Q6826 - 2014 - Pyramid = $18.75
1|QUOTE PRICE $18.70 $0.00 $0.00 $17.99 $18.73 $0.00 $0.00
ITEM#|DMPS SKU# S011033972
2|DESCRIPTION Sheet Protector, Clear, non glare 8 1/2 x 11", 3 hole punched School Smart 084904 - per spec
2|ESTIMATED USAGE 1164
2|MANUFACTURER NAME |Avery 74107 or School Smart 084904 BSN 16514 No Bid PYRAMID As Spec PREMIER 42294 20 PKS/CS
1111723 **MINIMUM ORDER
2|MANUFACTURER# Avery 74107 or School Smart 084904 No Bid No Bid 1S 200 PKG** As Spec
2(uOM PACK, 50sh/pk, 10pk/cn PACK, 50sh/pk, 10pk/cn PACK, 50sh/pk, 10pk/cn PACK, 50sh/pk, 10pk/cn PACK, 50sh/pk, 10pk/cn PACK, 50sh/pk, 10pk/cn PACK, 50sh/pk, 10pk/cn
2|PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Q6826 - 2014 - School Specialty = $1.87
2|QUOTE PRICE $2.35 $0.00 $0.00 $1.83 $1.69 $1.38 $0.00
ITEM#|DMPS SKU# 5011033975
3| DESCRIPTION Laminating Film, 25"x500'x1", core, 1.5 mil., clear
3|ESTIMATED USAGE 444
3|MANUFACTURER NAME  [Nap-Lam |,GBC 3000004 As Spec HOP As Spec As Spec No Bid GBC 3000004 AS SPEC GBC
**MINIMUM ORDER IS 100
3[MANUFACTURER# Nap-Lam I,GBC 3000004 As Spec LR-1.5X25/500 As Spec BX** No Bid
3luom 2 Rolls per box, 2rl/bx, 2bx/cs 2 Rolls per box, 2rl/bx, 2bx/cs 2 Rolls per box, 2rl/bx, 2bx/cs 2 Rolls per box, 2rl/bx, 2bx/cs 2 Rolls per box, 2rl/bx, 2bx/cs 2 Rolls per box, 2rl/bx, 2bx/cs 2 Rolls per box, 2rl/bx, 2bx/cs
3|PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Q6827 - 2014 - Pyramid = $38.38
3[QUOTE PRICE $38.10 $27.28 $34.90 $38.24] $0.00 $38.19 $38.30
ITEM#|DMPS SKU# 5011033977
4|DESCRIPTION LAMINATING POUCH,9"x11.5"-3mil
4|ESTIMATED USAGE 120
4|MANUFACTURER NAME |BSN20863 or Staples 677045 (STP17467) As Spec HOP As Spec PYRAMID No Bid
1679968 *100/BX*
**MINIMUM ORDER IS 30
4|MANUFACTURER# BSN20863 or Staples 677045 (STP17467) As Spec p-03x9x1112/100 As Spec BX** No Bid
4|UOM each, 50/box each, 50/box each, 50/box each, 50/box each, 50/box each, 50/box each, 50/box
4|PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE 2014 - Staples = $4.50
4|QUOTE PRICE $8.40 $3.33 $8.75 $6.89) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ITEM#| DMPS SKU# New
5|DESCRIPTION Laminating Film School Smart 100069 - per spec
5|ESTIMATED USAGE 60
5[MANUFACTURER NAME |A-Lam Premium School Laminate OR School Specialty (School Smart) As Spec HOP As Spec As Spec As Spec
**MINIMUM ORDER IS 20
5|MANUFACTURER# LFSG2188 or School Smart #1277261 As Spec LR-1.5x25/500IMP As Spec BX** As Spec
5(uoOM 2 rolls per box 2 rolls per box 2 rolls per box 2 rolls per box 2 rolls per box 2 rolls per box 2 rolls per box
5|PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE
5|QUOTE PRICE $45.70 $28.06 $34.90 $39.96 $54.38 $0.00 $0.00
Total Price: $ 24,523.80 | $ 14,195.52 | $ 18,639.60 | $ 23,412.48 | $ 6,353.76 | $ 18,562.68 | $ 17,005.20
$011033977, price per box is Minimum order for GBC is 200
Notes: for 100 not 50 Pricing valid through 12/31/15 [No minimum:s listed rolls, 400 boxes of 2

BID 7777374134, Acct #167846

2/bx sold each




