
Des Moines Public Schools

Instructions: We do not guarantee the required quantities as these are estimates only; based on 

an annual demand.

Des Moines Independent Community School District Complete the fields that are highlighted in orange in Column D.

Division of Purchasing To prevent disqualification do not alter the formatting on the worksheet.                                                      

1915 Prospect Road Suite 1200  All anticipated orders will be placed on an “as needed basis”.

Des Moines, IA  50310 Once the spreadsheet is complete email it to: 

Kathleen.Kahler@dmschools.org
Pricing must remain firm for 12 months, and must include all costs including freight, 

the District will not pay any additional costs for products delivered.

Pyramid School Products                      

Tampa FL 33610

STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 

CO  WHEELING IL 60090

Brown & Saenger                                 

Sioux Falls, SD 57104

Leading Edge                                        

Council Bluffs, IA 51501

School Specialty Inc                             

Lancaster, PA 17601

Elgin School Supply Co                         

Chico CA 95973
Koch Brothers, 

DM, IA

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033007

1 DESCRIPTION Plastic Comb Binding; 1/4" BLACK, 19 Ring As Spec No Bid

1 ESTIMATED USAGE 2500

1 MANUFACTURER NAME GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding 0 Bindaply School Smart Brand - $1.41

1 MANUFACTURER# GBC 40000020 or SW 014019RWBBLK GBC 40000020 or SW 014019RWBBLK 0

1 UOM each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx 100/bx

1 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger 2014 - Q6887 -$0.04 ea

1 QUOTE PRICE $0.04 $0.03 $0.0141 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033008

2 DESCRIPTION Plastic Comb Binding; 5/16" BLACK, 19 Ring As Spec No Bid

2 ESTIMATED USAGE 1800

2 MANUFACTURER NAME GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding Bindaply School Smart Brand - $1.68

2 MANUFACTURER# GBC 40000032 OR SW 51619WRBBLK GBC 40000032 OR SW 51619WRBBLKGBC 40000032 OR SW 51619WRBBLK GBC 40000032 OR SW 51619WRBBLK

2 UOM each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx 100/box

2 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6887 = 0.05 ea

2 QUOTE PRICE $0.04 $0.368 $0.0168 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033009

3 DESCRIPTION Plastic Comb Binding; 3/8" BLACK As Spec No Bid

3 ESTIMATED USAGE 2800

3 MANUFACTURER NAME GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding Bindaply School Smart Brand - $1.99

3 MANUFACTURER# GBC 40000044 OR SW 03819RWBBLK GBC 40000044 OR SW 03819RWBBLKGBC 40000044 OR SW 03819RWBBLK GBC 40000044 OR SW 03819RWBBLK

3 UOM each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx 100/box

3 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6887 = $0.038 ea

3 QUOTE PRICE $0.05 $0.0432 $0.0199 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033010

4 DESCRIPTION Plastic Comb Binding; 7/16" BLACK, 19 ring As Spec No Bid No Bid

4 ESTIMATED USAGE 1800

4 MANUFACTURER NAME GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding Bindaply

4 MANUFACTURER# SW Binding 71619RWBBLK SW Binding 71619RWBBLK SW Binding 71619RWBBLK SW Binding 71619RWBBLK

4 UOM each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx

4 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6887 = $0.05 ea

4 QUOTE PRICE $0.06 $0.0476 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033013

5 DESCRIPTION Plastic Comb Binding; 1/2" BLACK, 19 Ring As Spec No Bid

5 ESTIMATED USAGE 3600

5 MANUFACTURER NAME GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding Bindaply School Smart Brand - $2.72

5 MANUFACTURER# SW Binding 01219RWBBLK SW Binding 01219RWBBLK SW Binding 01219RWBBLK SW Binding 01219RWBBLK

5 UOM each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx each, 100/bx 100/box

5 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown - $0.065 ea

5 QUOTE PRICE $0.07 $0.055 $0.0272 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033016

6 DESCRIPTION Plastic Comb Binding; 3/4" BLACK, 19 Ring As Spec No Bid

6 ESTIMATED USAGE 900

6 MANUFACTURER NAME GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding Bindaply School Smart Brand - $4.78

6 MANUFACTURER# SW Binding 03419RWBBLK SW Binding 03419RWBBLK SW Binding 03419RWBBLK SW Binding 03419RWBBLK

6 UOM each, 100/box each, 100/box each, 100/box each, 100/box 100/box

6 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6887 = $0.10 ea

6 QUOTE PRICE $0.11 $0.0912 $0.0478 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033018

7 DESCRIPTION Plastic Comb Binding; 1" BLACK, 19 ring As Spec No Bid

7 ESTIMATED USAGE 1200

7 MANUFACTURER NAME GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding GBC or Southwest Binding Bindaply School Smart Brand - $4.21

7 MANUFACTURER# SW Binding 00119RWBBLK SW Binding 00119RWBBLK SW Binding 00119RWBBLK SW Binding 00119RWBBLK

7 UOM each, 50/box each, 50/box each, 50/box each, 50/box 50/box

7 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6887 = $0.17 ea
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Des Moines Public Schools

Pricing must remain firm for 12 months, and must include all costs including freight, 

the District will not pay any additional costs for products delivered.

Pyramid School Products                      

Tampa FL 33610

STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 

CO  WHEELING IL 60090

Brown & Saenger                                 

Sioux Falls, SD 57104

Leading Edge                                        

Council Bluffs, IA 51501

School Specialty Inc                             

Lancaster, PA 17601

Elgin School Supply Co                         

Chico CA 95973
Koch Brothers, 

DM, IA

7 QUOTE PRICE $0.17 $0.1644 $0.0842 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033130

8 DESCRIPTION Binder Clip, Mini 9/16" Wide, .25" capacity As Spec No Bid

8 ESTIMATED USAGE 744

8 MANUFACTURER NAME BSN 65364 Leonard General per spec School Smart Brand Leonard 50001

8 MANUFACTURER# BSN 65364 50001 BC-10

8 UOM PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/bx PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/bx PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/bx PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/bx 12/pk 12/pk

8 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874 = $0.16

8 QUOTE PRICE $0.19 $0.15 $0.16 $0.17 $0.31 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033131

9 DESCRIPTION Binder Clip, Small 3/4" Wide, .38" capacity As Spec

9 ESTIMATED USAGE 708

9 MANUFACTURER NAME BSN 36550 Pyramid General per spec No Bid School Smart Brand Leonard BC-02 per spec

9 MANUFACTURER# BSN 36550 1199660 BC-20

9 UOM PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn 12/pk 12/pk

9 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874 = $0.175

9 QUOTE PRICE $0.18 $0.168 $0.17 $0.18 $0.32 $0.19

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033132

10 DESCRIPTION Binder Clip, Medium 1.25" Wide, .63" capacity As Spec

10 ESTIMATED USAGE 816

10 MANUFACTURER NAME BSN 36551 Pyramid General per spec No Bid School Smart Brand Leoanrd BC -05 per spec

10 MANUFACTURER# BSN 36551 1110067 BC-50

10 UOM PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn 12/pk 12/pk

10 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874 = $0.39

10 QUOTE PRICE $0.39 $0.388 $0.40 $0.38 $0.55 $0.52

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033133

11 DESCRIPTION Binder Clips, Large 2" Wide, 1" capacity As Spec

11 ESTIMATED USAGE 348

11 MANUFACTURER NAME BSN 36552 Pyramid General per spec No Bid School Smart Brand Leonard BC - 10 per spec

11 MANUFACTURER# BSN 36552 1116075 BC-100

11 UOM PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn PACK, 12/pk, 12pk/cn 12/pk 12/pk

11 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874 =$1.06

11 QUOTE PRICE $1.05 $1.04 $1.08 $0.92 $1.65 $1.47

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033171

12 DESCRIPTION Clipboard, letter size, 9"x12.5", brown hardboard with stainless steel clip As Spec

12 ESTIMATED USAGE 2004

12 MANUFACTURER NAME BSN 65637 Pyramid Standards per spec No Bid School Smart Brand Leonard 89003 per spec

12 MANUFACTURER# BSN 65637 1162437 5612

12 UOM EACH, 12/bx, 48/cs EACH, 12/bx, 48/cs EACH, 12/bx, 48/cs EACH, 12/bx, 48/cs 12/pk 48/cs, minimum order 960

12 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown - $0.63

12 QUOTE PRICE $0.62 $0.62 $0.63 $0.72 $0.85 $0.85

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033256

13 DESCRIPTION PAPER CLIPS; No.1 Standard 100/box, As Spec

13 ESTIMATED USAGE 2688

13 MANUFACTURER NAME BSN 65638 Leonard Officemate per spec No Bid School Smart Brand No Bid per spec

13 MANUFACTURER# BSN 65638 210E PC-1

13 UOM box, 10bx/carton box, 10bx/carton box, 10bx/carton box, 10bx/carton 100/box

13 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874 = $0.145

13 QUOTE PRICE $0.145 $0.142 $0.15 $0.14 $0.15

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033257

14 DESCRIPTION PAPER CLIPS; LARGE 100/bx, As Spec No Bid per spec

14 ESTIMATED USAGE 2244

14 MANUFACTURER NAME BSN 65639 Leonard Officemate per spec No Bid School Smart Brand

14 MANUFACTURER# BSN 65639 301E PC-G

14 UOM bx. 10bx/cn bx. 10bx/cn bx. 10bx/cn bx. 10bx/cn 100/box

14 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874 =  $0.38

14 QUOTE PRICE $0.38 $0.45 $0.38 $0.42 $0.41

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033265

15 DESCRIPTION Finger Grips, No. 11 Small As Spec As Spec No Bid No Bid

15 ESTIMATED USAGE 12

15 MANUFACTURER NAME OIC FG No.11 OIC FG No.11 OIC FG No.11 OIC FG No.11 Acco Brand
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15 MANUFACTURER# OIC FG No.11 OIC FG No.11 OIC FG No.11 OIC FG No.11

15 UOM pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk 12/pk

15 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE $.99 - Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874

15 QUOTE PRICE $1.14 $1.09 $1.39 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033266

16 DESCRIPTION Finger Grips, No 12 Medium As Spec As Spec No Bid No Bid

16 ESTIMATED USAGE 12

16 MANUFACTURER NAME OIC FG No.12 OIC FG No.12 OIC FG No.12 OIC FG No.12 Acco Brand

16 MANUFACTURER# OIC FG No.12 OIC FG No.12 OIC FG No.12 OIC FG No.12

16 UOM pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk 12/pk

16 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE $.99 - Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874

16 QUOTE PRICE $1.14 $1.09 $1.39 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033267

17 DESCRIPTION Finger Grips, No 13 Large As Spec As Spec No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 ESTIMATED USAGE 12

17 MANUFACTURER NAME OIC FG No.13 OIC FG No.13 OIC FG No.13 OIC FG No.13

17 MANUFACTURER# OIC FG No.13 OIC FG No.13 OIC FG No.13 OIC FG No.13

17 UOM pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk

17 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE $.99 - Brown-Saenger - 2014 - Q6874

17 QUOTE PRICE $1.14 $1.09 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033810

18 DESCRIPTION Loose Leaf Book Ring, 2", 12/pk No Bid No Bid

18 ESTIMATED USAGE 84

18 MANUFACTURER NAME Office Max OM99846 Office Max OM99846 General School Smart Brand Leonard R-59

18 MANUFACTURER# Office Max OM99846 Office Max OM99846 BR-6

18 UOM pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk pack, 12/pk 50/pk 12/pk

18 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE $1.04 - Office Max - 2014 - Q9874

18 QUOTE PRICE $0.92 $2.23 $1.29 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# S011033820

19 DESCRIPTION Loose Leaf Book Ring, 1", 40/pk No Bid No Bid

19 ESTIMATED USAGE 228

19 MANUFACTURER NAME Office Max OM99845 Office Max OM99845 General School Smart Brand Leonard R-29

19 MANUFACTURER# Office Max OM99845 Office Max OM99845 BR-3

19 UOM pack, 40/pk pack, 40/pk pack, 40/pk pack, 40/pk 100/pk 40/pk

19 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE $1.92 - Office Max - 2014 - Q6874

19 QUOTE PRICE $1.74 $2.42 $2.79 $0.00

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW

20 DESCRIPTION PLASTIC CLIPBOARD As Spec No Bid No Bid

20 ESTIMATED USAGE 96

20 MANUFACTURER NAME PLEASE SUBMIT PICTURES, IF WE WANT SAMPLE, WE WILL REQUEST ONE Leonard PLEASE SUBMIT PICTURES, IF WE PLEASE SUBMIT PICTURES, IF WE Saunders Brand Pix attached

20 MANUFACTURER# 89710 $0.00 0

20 UOM EACH, DZ/CARTON EACH, DZ/CARTON EACH, DZ/CARTON EACH, DZ/CARTON each

20 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE NEW FOR 2015

20 QUOTE PRICE $2.89 $2.80 $3.15 $1.13

Total Price: $3,714.84 $4,058.09 $4,658.96 $1,421.40 $5,083.87 $3,928.08

Notes: Photo submitted for #20 Photo submitted for #20 All combs are Bindaply by Innove BID 7777277959 must be on all items
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