Des Moines Public Schools

DesMoines
PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid / Quote: Q6954
Date: 3/10/14
Supervisor: Mel Green
Department: Custodial Services
AmSan Capital Sanitary | Egan Supply Co | Egan Supply Co | First Choice Hillyard Hillyard lowa DSM

Description Qty| UOM| Urbandale, IA Des Moines, IA Omaha, NE Omaha, NE Des Moines, IA | Urbandale, IA| Urbandale, IA | Des Moines, IA
Upright Vacuum 20 | Each | $ 156.00 | $ 167.74 | $ 172.85 S 149.00 | $ 273.25 | S 252.07 | $ 173.95
Make: Advance / Renown Renown Advance Advance Clean Max Pro Proteam Tennant Advance
Model: Ad Vac High Per 12/ REN08025 REN08025| ReliaVac 12 HP AP-03004A CMPS-1IN| PTM 105379 1060829 12HP

2 years motor,
Warranty: 1 year 1year 1 year limited 1 year vacuum 3/3/3 Life 1year
Deliver ARO: 10 days 7-14 days 7-10 days 7-10 days 21 days 21 days 14 days
Portable Backpack Vacuum 12 | Each | $ 290.00f S 277.94| S 316.51| $ 279.00| $ 237.70| $ 289.36| S 248.86 No Bid
Make: Proteam Proteam Proteam Proteam Mosquito | Clean Max BP Proteam Mosquito No Bid
Model: Super coach Pro # 10 Super coach 10| Super coach 10 PT-107304A( MO-10-1011EA CMBP-6 107303 Super Mosquito No Bid
3 yrs parts,labor,
motor. Lifetime

Warranty: body 3years| 7yearslimited| 7 years limited 1 year 3/3/3 Life NR No Bid
Deliver ARO: 10 7-14 days 7-10 days 7-10 days 7-10 days 21 days 21 days No Bid
|Tota| | S 6,600.00| S 6,690.08| S 7,255.12| S 3,348.00| S 5,832.40| S 8,937.32| S 8,027.72| S 3,479.00|

Notes: CapSan price good until 3/28/14 after 3/31/14 the price is $300.00
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