Des Moines Public Schools

DesMoines | |
PUBLIC SCHOOLS Bid Tabulation
Bid / Quote: Q6659
Date: 1/3/13
Supervisor: Gary McClanahan
Department: Central Campus
GameTime
Cover Sports Gopher Sports Athletics Riddell Athletics
ltem Qty |[UOM| Philadelphia, PA Owatonna, MN Platte City, MO Elyria, OH
Gym Floor Cover 32 oz 9,000(SqFt| S 8,100.00 No Bid| $ 7,150.00 No Bid
Color: No response Tan or Gray No Bid
Warranty: 17 yrs No Bid 17 yrs No Bid
Make / Model: GymGuard No Bid CoverSports No Bid
No Bid
Gym Floor Cover 27 oz 9,000(SqFt| S 7,500.00( $ 7,920.08] $ 6,500.00 No Bid
Color: No response Tan Tan or Gray No Bid
Warranty: 15 yrs Unconditional 15 yrs No Bid
Make / Model: GymGuard GymGuard Cover Sports No Bid
No Bid
Gym Floor Covering Rack 1 Ea | S 2,230.00( S 2,813.53| S 1,900.00 No Bid
2800 Ibs/holds 10
Capacity: rolls Hold 10 rolls 3000 lbs 8 rolls No Bid
Warranty: 20 yrs Unconditional 20 yrs No Bid
Number of wheels: 6 8 4 No Bid
Make / Model: GymGuard GymGuard CoverSports No Bid
Optional Brush: 1 Ea S 415.00| S 628.63| S 400.00 No Bid
Optional Winch 1 Ea | S 615.00| S 905.83| S 610.00 No Bid
Leg Extenders 1 Ea NA NA| S 225.00 No Bid
No Bid
Rectangular Basketball Backboard 4 Ea S -1S 4,153.96| S 3,620.00 No Bid
Rim Mfg: No Bid Gared Bison No Bid
Make / Model: No Bid| Gared Conversion Bison OFC 4234 No Bid
No Bid
Total $ 9,730.00[ $ 14,887.57| $ 12,020.00 No Bid
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