
Des Moines Public Schools

Bid / Quote: B6523

Date: 5/21/2012

Supervisor: David Silver

Department: Facility Mgt

Qty:  See Below 

Description Qty UOM

American 

Alarms             

Des Moines, IA

Iowa Fire Eqiupt                  

Des Moines, IA

Midwest Alarms                

Des Moines, IA

Midwest Auto 

Fire Sprinkler                        

Des Moines, 

IA

Protex 

Central     

Des Moines, 

IA

Simplex Grinnell            

Urbandale, IA

Viking 

Sprinkler  

Ankeny, IA

White Cap 

Const                 

Des Moines, 

IA

Sprinkler  Subcontract 

Cost of wet systems 58 Each Non Repsonsive  $                 90.00 Non Repsonsive  $          166.00  $         80.00  $               75.36  No Bid  No Bid 

Cost of dry systems 12 Each Non Repsonsive  $              140.00 Non Repsonsive  $          304.00  $       120.00  $             100.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cost for additional inpsections - wet 1 Each Non Repsonsive  $              102.00 Non Repsonsive  $          166.00  $       110.00  $               85.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cost for additional inpsections - dry 1 Each Non Repsonsive  $              140.00 Non Repsonsive  $          304.00  $       150.00  $             100.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cost for annual pump inspection 2 Each Non Repsonsive  $              160.00 Non Repsonsive  $          152.00  $       132.00  $             175.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Repair Service - Standard 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $                 95.00 Non Repsonsive  $            69.00  $         90.00  $               87.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Repair Service - Sunday & Holiday 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              190.00 Non Repsonsive  $          138.00  $       150.00  $             127.50  No Bid  No Bid 

Repair Service - Emergency 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              142.50 Non Repsonsive  $          103.50  $       120.00  $             127.50  No Bid  No Bid 

Total Wet & Dry Non Repsonsive  $           7,220.00 Non Repsonsive  $     13,580.00  $    6,344.00  $          5,920.88  No Bid  No Bid 

Fire Alarm Testing

Annual Cost for Testing (per wksht) 1 Each Non Repsonsive  $         17,337.50 Non Repsonsive  $     10,164.00  $    9,680.00  $        16,703.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Fire Alarm Service - Standard 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $                 95.00 Non Repsonsive  $            80.00  $         80.00  $             120.00  No Bid  No Bid 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Description Qty UOM

American 

Alarms             

Des Moines, IA

Iowa Fire Eqiupt                  

Des Moines, IA

Midwest Alarms                

Des Moines, IA

Midwest Auto 

Fire Sprinkler                        

Des Moines, 

IA

Protex 

Central     

Des Moines, 

IA

Simplex Grinnell            

Urbandale, IA

Viking 

Sprinkler  

Ankeny, IA

White Cap 

Const                 

Des Moines, 

IA

Fire Alarm Service - Sunday & Holiday 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              190.00 Non Repsonsive  $          160.00  $       160.00  $             180.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Fire Alarm Service - Emergency 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              142.50 Non Repsonsive  $          120.00  $       120.00  $             180.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Systems Capability Non Repsonsive  No Repsonse Non Repsonsive  All  All  Simplex, Ansul  No Bid  No Bid 

Licensed in City of DMS Non Repsonsive  Yes Non Repsonsive  Yes  Yes  Yes  No Bid  No Bid 

Total Fire Alarm Testing Non Repsonsive  $         17,337.50 Non Repsonsive  $     10,164.00  $    9,680.00  $        16,703.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cooking Hood Testing

Annual Cost for Testing (per wksht) 1 Each Non Repsonsive  $           2,209.00 Non Repsonsive  $       6,132.00  $    5,840.00  $          5,230.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Hood Testing - Standard 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $                 95.00 Non Repsonsive  $            80.00  $         80.00  $               98.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Hood Testing - Sunday & Holday 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              190.00 Non Repsonsive  $          160.00  $       160.00  $             147.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Hood Testing - Emergency 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              142.50 Non Repsonsive  $          120.00  $       120.00  $             147.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Total Cooking Hoods Non Repsonsive  $           2,209.00  Non Repsonsive  $       6,132.00  $    5,840.00  $          5,230.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Fire Extinguishers Alt #1

Monthly fire extinguishers testing 12 Each Non Repsonsive  $           4,746.00 Non Repsonsive  $       3,454.00  $    3,454.00  $          2,512.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Fire Extinguishers 200 Each Non Repsonsive  $                 31.45 Non Repsonsive  $            52.00  $         52.00  $               43.00  No Bid  No Bid 

 Make Proposed: Buckeye Non Repsonsive  As Specified Non Repsonsive  As Specified  As Specified  As Specified  No Bid  $         29.50 

 Model Proposed: 5 ABC Non Repsonsive  As Specified Non Repsonsive  As Specified  As Specified  As Specified  No Bid  As Specified 

Total Testing Non Repsonsive  $         56,952.00 Non Repsonsive  $     41,448.00  $  41,448.00  $        30,144.00  No Bid  No Bid 
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Des Moines Public Schools

Description Qty UOM

American 

Alarms             

Des Moines, IA

Iowa Fire Eqiupt                  

Des Moines, IA

Midwest Alarms                

Des Moines, IA

Midwest Auto 

Fire Sprinkler                        

Des Moines, 

IA

Protex 

Central     

Des Moines, 

IA

Simplex Grinnell            

Urbandale, IA

Viking 

Sprinkler  

Ankeny, IA

White Cap 

Const                 

Des Moines, 

IA

Total Fire Extinguishers Non Repsonsive  $           6,290.00 Non Repsonsive  $     10,400.00  $  10,400.00  $          8,600.00  No Bid  $    5,900.00 

Backflow Testing Alt # 2  Subcontract 

Annual Cost for Testing (per wksht) 227 Each Non Repsonsive  $                 75.00 Non Repsonsive  $            99.00  $         45.00  $               18.50  No Bid  No Bid 

Backflow Testing - Standard 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $                 95.00 Non Repsonsive  $            99.00  $       110.00  $               87.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Backflow Testing - Sunday & Holiday 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              190.00 Non Repsonsive  $          148.50  $       150.00  $             127.50  No Bid  No Bid 

Backflow Testing - Emergency 1 Hour Non Repsonsive  $              142.50 Non Repsonsive  $          198.50  $       120.00  $             127.50  No Bid  No Bid 

Total Backflow Testing Non Repsonsive  $         17,025.00 Non Repsonsive  $     22,473.00  $  10,215.00  $          4,200.07  No Bid  No Bid 

Base Bid Total Non Repsonsive  $         26,766.50 Non Repsonsive  $     29,876.00  $  21,864.00  $        27,853.88  No Bid  $    5,900.00 

Base Bid w/ Alt #1 Non Repsonsive  $         83,718.50 Non Repsonsive  $     71,324.00  $  63,312.00  $        57,997.88  No Bid  No Bid 

Base Bid w/ Alt #1 & #2 Non Repsonsive  $       100,743.50 Non Repsonsive  $     93,797.00  $  73,527.00  $        62,197.95  No Bid  No Bid 

Revised form # 2 Yes Yes  Yes  Yes Yes No  Yes 
Addedum Included No No  Yes  Yes Yes No  Yes 

Addedum Not Included

Sprinkler & Backflow = Viking

B6523 Fire Protection Products Services 3 6/4/2012


